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(Contract Management Use only) o é
CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM 4
CONTRACT 29
TRACKING NO. & 5
CONTRACTOR INFORMATION , CM2644 B
W Ricoh/Copyfax
Address: 8475 Western Way, Suite 100 Jacksonville FL 32256
City State Zip
Contractor’s Administrator Name: ionard Durant Title:

To:  (904)296-1600 . (904)296-7111 . . richard.durant@copyfax.com

CONTRACT INFORMATION
Contract Name: -©@5€/Maintenance and Supply Agreement Coutract Value: $6,950.88

Lease and Maintenance and Supply Agreement for MPC4504EX at Yulee Y_g_r_d: US Communities 4400003732

Brief Description:

Contract Dates ; From: _|3/2C/I& w: 1225\ suts: X New Renew Amend# ___ WA/Task Order

HowProcured: ___ Sole Source ___SingleSource ___ITB ___RFP ___RFQ XX Coop. ___ Other

If Processing an Amendment:

Contract #: Increase Amount of Existing Contract:

New Contrnct Dms TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT:
( ALS PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6
/2- /3r,y Road and Bridge

artment Head Signature % ﬁ?m’men g';
2. o MM%__
Contféct Management (/_ Date Funding Source/Acct # m o T

wlmhq

¥ //omﬁfAttoméy/(ﬁyyf {,{dfo on]y)/ 7 lnaj Ztlffcee odd u"l

Comments:

© RCYD COUNE
W SIGNATURE /¢ . 14DEC'13 ¢

%aéi’Mullm £y // 4 D te

RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS:
Original: Clerk’s Services; Contractor (original or certified copy)
Copy: Department
Office of Management & Budget
Contract Management
Clerk Finance

Revised 4/05/2017

¥ M
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COPYFAX«é

OCTOBER 30,2018

PROPOSAL
FOR
NASSAU COUNTY
ROAD & BRIDGE
RICOH MPC4504EX COLOR. COPIER 3 12144
PB33240 PAPER FEED UNIT 16.13
SR3210 FINISHER-STAPLER 2.73
BU3070 BRIDGE UNIT 215
PU3050 PUNCH UNIT 929
FAX OPTION M20 1334
FEATURES: 45 PRINTS PER MINUTE
SCAN-PRINT-COPY-FAX
SORT-STAPLE-PUNCH

36 MONTH LEASE AT §183.08 PER MONTH

U 'S COMMUNITIES 4400003732

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT

TO INCLUDE ALL PARTS, LABOR, SERVICE CALLS AND
SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND STAPLES. MONOCHROME
PRINTS AT $.0059 PER PRINT. COLOR PRINTS AT §.045 PER

COLOR PRINT.
Jackzenville Galnesville Bench
nmw-_-v-r“ reynd 5'...... .
- e, L3200 Syt Bech FLIZIM
9100 o 3533361 771 Prone398253 3292
PcISLTASI

WWW.COPYFAX.COM §Eng Oe=sts

s s A
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' 11/29/2018

Solutions

BY SUPPLIER ( show olf »)

BY CATEGORY
Facilities
Office & School

Specialty
Technology

Main Menu

JUMP TO:

Solicitations

News & Events
Resources

Contact Us

Education Purchasing
Government Purchasing
Nonprofit

bamicmesmmssan ssms = = ame

Go Green Prcgn}n

Getting Started

Ricoh Contract | U.S. Communities

About News & Events Resources Contact Us
PRODUCT: S & SOLUTIONS CONTRACT DOCUMENTS REGISTER LOGIt
Home > Ricoh > Ricoh Contract
Multifunction Devices/Managed Print Services
Contract Documents:
Lead Agency: Contract Number 4400003732
Fairfax County, Virginia
Notice of Award
Contract Number: Contract Amendments
4400003732 Master Lease Agreement
Equipment Sale and Maintenance
Agreement

3 year, S month initlal term, February 11, 2013 - June 30, 2016
Option to renew for (6) additional (1) year periods or any combination thereof
The contract Is renewed for three (3) years, effective July 1, 2016 through

June 30, 2019
RFP Documents:
& RFP 2 264
&= Contract Updates 000000
Attachment A
Amendment 7 added to Contract Amendments on August 15, 2017
Attachment A 1
REQUEST INFORMATION Attachment B
ya Attachment C
2000000264 Addenda
RFP Posting Document

Postings
No, of suppliers who responded to RFP; 3

Date Posted:
May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012

Posting Information:

U.S. Communities: Current Solicitations

Canadian MERX Public Tenders May 11, 2012 to june 19, 2012
Onvia Demand Star May 11, 2012 to june 19, 2012
Falrfax County May 11, 2012 to june 19, 2012
Assoclation of Oregon Countles May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012

May 11, 2012 to june 19, 2012

State of Hawall and Oregon

Why Use U.S. Communities Discounts on Brands Ovar 55,000 agencles trust U.S.

o Pracram Cherview

& What Makec 1 1< Niifarant o Pradaric R Surnnlises ® Whallka< 1S Fammimitisc

By clicking accepl, you indicate that you have read and understand otirTerms of Use

Accept

hitps:/iwww,uscommunities.org/suppliersiricoh/ricoh-contract/ 2




" 11129/2018 Ricoh Contract | U.S. Communities
CONTACT US BECOME A SUPPLIER ABOUTUS TERMS OF USE PRIVACY MICPA

© 3018 U8 Communtiles | Al Rights Reserved.

By clicking accept, you indicate that you have read and understand ourTerms of Use

Accept

hitos:/Awww.uscommunities.ora/suppliers/ricoh/ricoh-contract/




: George Aviles

From: George Aviles

Sent: Thursday, December 13, 2018 1:39 PM

To: Grayson Hagins

Ce: Becky Bray; Shelley Caldwell (scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com); Cameron Hansen; Jennifer
Kirkland; Norma Jean Angeles (njangeles@nassaucountyfl.com)

Subject: FW: 2 Contracts

Attachments: 20181203073903487.pdf; 20181203073913571.pdf

Good Afternoon Grayson,

See below on 12-03-18, | answered funding questions about these two contracts (Attachments) to Shelley?

George Aviles Jr., Office Manager
Nassau County Road & Bridge Dept Florida

| put those in an interoffice envelope to Road and Bridge on 11/29. I'm somehow guessing those weren’t received?...

Grayson Hagins

Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6

Yulee, FL 32097

ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com
(904) 530-6040

From: Jennifer Kirkland

Sent: Thursday, December 13, 2018 1:33 PM

To: George Aviles <gaviles@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: FW: 2 Contracts

Is this what you are looking for?

Jennifer Kirkland
904.530.6180

From: George Aviles

Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 8:17 AM

To: Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>

Cc: Becky Bray <bbray@nassaucountyfl.com>; Cameron Hansen <chansen@nassaucountyfl.com>; Jennifer Kirkland
<jkirkland @nassaucountyfl.com>; Brandi Jordan <bjordan@nassaucountyfl.com>; Norma Jean Angeies

<njangeles@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: FW: 2 Contracts

Good Morning Ma’am,

The funding code for CM2643 & CM2644

R R R R R R R R R
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are the same, Accounts 03400541-544000
& 03400541-546020.

George Aviles Jr., Office Manager
Nassau County Road & Bridge Dept Florida

From: Norma Jean Angeles

Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 7:48 AM

To: George Aviles <gaviles@nassaucountyfl.com>

Cc: Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: 2 Contracts

Good morning George,
in your scan folder, see attached two (2) contracts as noted per Shelley.

Thank you.

Norma-Jean C. Angeles
Road and Bridge Fleet Management
96161 Nassau Place

Yulee, FL 32097

Phone (904) 530-6178

Emall: NJAngeles@nassaucountyfl.com

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone or in

writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone or in

writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone orin

writing.




Peggx Snxder

From: Richard Durant <richard.durant@copyfax.com>

Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 9:06 AM

To: Grayson Hagins

Subject: Re: FW: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh Copyfax
Will do.

On Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 8:57 AM Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com> wrote:

Richard,

We will need to proceed with the Cancellation of CM2644 for the Yulee Yard. They will be purchasing a small
personal copier/printer. Please confirm receipt and thank you for all of your help.

Grayson Hagins

Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6

Yulee, FL 32097

ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com
(904) 530-6040

From: Richard Durant <richard.durant@copyfax.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 08, 2019 9:58 AM

To: Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh Copyfax

I won't cancel order until they make final decision.

On Tue, Jan 8, 2019 at 9:28 AM Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com> wrote:




I believe they are re-evaluating which way they want to go, but I would think they would be going smaller.
Thanks Richard.

Grayson Hagins

Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6

Yulee, FL 32097

ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com

(904) 530-6040

From: Richard Durant <richard.durant@copyfax.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 08, 2019 9:24 AM

To: Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh Copyfax

We can. Do they want a smaller machine?

On Tue, Jan 8, 2019 at 8:48 AM Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com> wrote:

Good morning Richard,

Is it possible to cancel Contract CM2644 for the Yulee yard? Due to the amount of employees there, this
equipment is just too big for their needs. Please advise. Thank you.

Grayson Hagins
Contract/Purchasing Manager
Nassau County Board of County Commissioners

96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6




| | Yulee, FL 32097

- ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com

- (904) 530-6040

| | From: Grayson Hagins
' Sent: Thursday, December 27, 2018 9:22 AM
' | To: Richard Durant <richard.durant@copyfax.com>
. Subject: FW: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh Copyfax

- Good morning,

. For your records please see the attached finalized contract approval form. Thank you.

Grayson Hagins

| Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of Commissioners
' 96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6
Yulee, FL. 32097

- ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com

| | (904) 530-6040

' ' Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact
this office by phone or in writing.

N
' Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in

3




response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact
this office by phone or in writing,.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact
| this office by phone or in writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact
this office by phone or in writing.




Pegﬂx Snxder

From: Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com>

Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 4:48 PM

To: Brenda Linville; Melissa Lucey; Heather Nazworth; Peggy Snyder; Jennifer Kirkland;
Amber Carter

Subject: FW: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh Copyfax

Attachments: 20181227091403904.pdf; Re: FW: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh
Copyfax

Good afternoon,

The department has decided to cancel their order with Ricoh and Ricoh confirmed the cancellation. Attached is the
email for backup. Please consider CM2644 no longer active. Thanks

Grayson Hagins

Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6

Yulee, FL 32097

ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com
(904) 530-6040

From: Grayson Hagins

Sent: Thursday, December 27, 2018 9:10 AM

To: Cameron Hansen <chansen@nassaucountyfl.com>; George Aviles <gaviles@nassaucountyfl.com>; Heather
Nazworth <hnazworth@nassauclerk.com>; Peggy Snyder <psnyder@nassauclerk.com>; Brenda Linville
<blinville@nassauclerk.com>; Melissa Lucey <mlucey@nassauclerk.com>; Chris Lacambra
<clacambra@nassaucountyfl.com>; Amber Carter <acarter@nassaucountyfl.com>; Grayson Hagins

<ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: Contract Approval Forms CM2643 and 2644 Ricoh Copyfax

Good morning,

For your records please see the attached finalized contract approval form. The original will be sent to the clerk services
and a copy sent to the vendor. Thank you.

Grayson Hagins

Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6

Yulee, FL 32097
ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com

(904) 530-6040

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a




public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone orin
writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this
office by phone or in writing.




